
No. 10 Capital Markets And Securities (Amendments) 

THE CAPITAL MARKETS AND SECURITIES (AMENDMENTS) 
ACT, 2010 

ARRANGEMENTS OF SECTIONS 

Section Title 
PART! 

PRELLMINARY PROVISIONS 

1. Short title. 

PARTll 
GENERAL AMENDMENTS 

2. Amendment of section 2. 
3. Amendment of section 10. 
4. Amendment of section 15. 
5. Amendment of section 18. 
6. Amendment of section 20. 
7. Amendment of section 21. 
8. A.mendment of section 22. 
9. Amendment of section 23. 
10. Amendment of section 25. 
11. Amendment of secti on 28. 
12. Amendment of section 30. 
13. Amendment of section 31. 
14. Amendment of section 32. 
15. Repeal of sections 33. 34 and 35. 
16. Amendment of section 39. 
17. Amendment of section 48. 
18. Repealing of section 49. 
19. Amendment of section 50. 
20. Amendment of section 52. 
21. Amendment of section 59. 
22. Amendment of section 60. 
23. Amendment of section 61. 
24. Amendment of section 63. 
25. Amendment of section 64. 
26. Amendment of section 65. 

1 

I 
; 

'J 

2010 



2 No. 10 Capital Markets And Securities (Amendments) 2010 

27. Amendment of section 67. 
')Q Amendment of section 69. ~'-J. 

29. Amendment of section 70. 
30. Amendment of section 72. 
3l. Amendment of section 95. 
32. Amendment of section 97. 
33. Amendment of sections 98, 101 and 102. 
34. Amendment of section 106. 
35. Amendment of secti on 107. 
36. Amendment of section 113. 
37. Amendment of section 115. 
38. Amendment of section 116. ~ 

39. Amendment of sections 122, 125, 126 and ]27. 
40. Amendment of section 129. 
41. Amendment of section 131. 
42. Amendment of section 134. 
43. Amendment of section 135. 
44. Amendment of secti on 136. 
45. Addition of new Parts. 
46. Amendment of section 140. 
47. Amendment of section 143. 
48. Amendment of section 144. 
49. Addition of section 147A. 
50. Addition of section 151. 



4 No.1U Capital Markets And Securities (Amendments) 2U1U 

(a) inserting in their appropriate alphabetical order 
the following new definitions: 
"enterprise growth market" means a stock market 

segment that facilitates trading of 
securities of start up, small and medium 
size companies; 

"market intennediary" means an individual or 
corporate body whose activities are 
provided for under tills Act including but 
not limited to dealers, dealers' 
representatives, investment advisors, 
in~~stment advisors' representatives, 
nominated advisors, nominated advisors' 
representati ves, stock exchanges, 
collective investment schemes, securities 
depositories and custodian of securities; 

"'nominated advisor's" means a company licensed 
by the authority to undertake the 
responsibility of nurturing and assisting 
an issuer for a public office of securities, 
listing of those securities on the enterprise 
growth market of the stock exchange and 
advising the issuer listed on the enterprise 
growth market. 

"nominated advisors representative" means a 
person in full time employment of a 
nominatec;i advisor, who performs for such 
nominated advisor any of the functions of 
the nominated advisor; 

"Tribunal" means the Capit.al Markets Tribunal 
established under this Act. 

(b) deleting the definition of the word "securities" 
and substituting for it the following new 
definition: 
"'"securities" includes-

(a) debentures, stock, shares, bonds or 
notes issued or proposed to be 
issued by a body corporate and 



NU.1U . L'apital M_arkets And Securities (Amendments) 2U1U 

any right, wan'ant or option in 
respect thereof; 

5 

(b) bonds or other loan instrument of 
tbe Government of Tanzania or of 
an yother country or corporation; 

(c) rights or interests, whether 
described as units or otherwise 
under any collective investment 
schen1e; 

(d) any right: warrant, option or futures 
in respect of any debenture, stocks, 
shares, bonas, notes or in respect of 
commodities; 

(e) options and warrants on shares, 
depository receipts, derivatives and 
options on derivatives; 

(f) such other rights, interests or 
instnlments as the Authority may, 
by notice published in the Gazette 
prescribe:" 

Anlendment 3. The principal Act is amended in section 10 by 
of section 10 repeaijng it and substituting for it the following: 

"Functions 10~-(1) Subject to the 
and powers provisions of this Act, the Authority 
of the shaH have the duty to-
Authority 

(a) reguiate the securities 
market; 

(b) protect the interests of 
investors in securities; 

(c) promote and facilitate 
the development of 
securities market; and 

(d) conduct public education 
programmes. 

(2) Without prejudice to the 
prOVIsIons of subsection ( 1), the 
Authority shall have powers to-



6 No.IU Capital Markets And Securities (Amendments) 2UIU 

(a) advise the Minister on 
all matters relating to 
the securities industry; 

(b) maintain surveillance 
over securities business; 

(c) ensure orderly, fair and 

equitable dealings In 
secuniles; 
(d) register, authorise, 

approve and regulate in 
accordance \X.i'ith this 
Act, stock exchanges, 
dealers, dealers' 
representati ves, 
investment advisors, 
investment advisors' 
representati yes, 
collecti ve investment 
schemes and other 
market intermediaries; 

(e) regulate and supervise 
the activities of dealers, 
dealers' r~presentatives, 

investments advisors, 
investment advisors' 
representati ves and 
other market 
intermediaries with a 
VIew to maintaining 
proper standards of 
conduct and 
professionalis111 in the 
securities business; 

(f) fannulate principles for 
the guidance of the 
industry; 



No. 10 CapitallVlarkets And Securities (Amendments) 2010 7 

(g) detenrune licensing 
criteria, conditions auG 
the ffilrumum capital 
requirements for a 
licensed, approved, 
registered, authorized or 
regulated persons 
depending on the size of 
"por'lt;ODC' 'lnd n'sl" v '-'1 (U,J 1,;) Uti .. .. .. , 

(h) monitor the solvency of 
licence holders and take 
rn.easures to protect the 
interest of customers 
where the solvency of 
any such licence holder 
is in doubt; 

(i) inquire into the affairs 
of, or conduct routine or 
ad hoc inspections of 
the books and records of 
any licensed, 
authorized, registered, 
approved or regulated 
person and any public 
compan y or Issuer of 
the securities; 

U) adopt measures to 
minimize and supervise 
any conflict of interest 
that may arise; 

(k) review, 
regulate 
mergers, 
and all 

approve and 
takeovers, 

acquisitions 
forms of 

business combination in 
accordance wi th an y 
existing rules of practice 
authorizing or requiring 
t.'1e Authority to do so; 



No. ]U Capital Markets And Securities (Amendments) 201U 

Cap.212 

(I) create the necessary 
environment for the 
orderl y growth and 
development of the 
capital market; 

(m) perform the functions 
req ul red to be 
performed by the 
Authority under the 
Companies Act; 

(n) conduct inve~tigations 

where the Authority has 
reasons to believe that: 
(i) transaction 1 n 

securities IS 

dealt with in a 
market 111 a 
manner which 
lS detrimental 
to the investors 
or securities 
markets; or 

(ii) a market 
in te nnedi ary 
which violated 
this Act or the 
directions 
issued by the 
Authority; 

(0) call for information 
from any person and 
undertake, inspect, 
conduct inquiries and 
audits of any market 
intermediaries including 
a stock exchange, 
collective investment 
scheme or a public 
company; 



~o. 1U CapitaL Markets And Securities (Anlendments) 2U10 

(p) call for or furnish any 
agency such information 
as may be considered 
necessary by it for the 
efficient discharge of its 
functions; 

(q) levy fees or other 
charges on an y person 
for carryIng out 
securities business In 
Tanzania: 

(r) conduct research into all 
aspects of' securities 
industry; 

(s) disqualify unfit 
indi viduals from being 
employed anywhere in 
the securities industry; 

(t) liaise effectively \vith 
the regulators and 
supervIsors of other 
financial institutions 
locally and overseas: 

(u) do anything which IS 

c alcu) ated to faci Ii tate 
the discharge of its 
functions, or IS 

incidental or conducive 
to its discharge, under 
this Act; 

(v) issue notices, circulars, 
conditions and 
guidelines as the 
Authority considers 
liecessary for effecti ve 
adrni nistration of the 
provislons of this Act; 

and 



1U No.1U Capital Markets And Securities (Amendments) 2U1U 

Amendment of 
section 15 

Amendment of 
section 18 

Amendment of 
section 20 

(w) undertake such other 
acti vities. as are 
necessary or expedient 
for giving full effect to 
the provisions of this 
Act. " 

4. The principal Act is amended in section 15 by -
(a) deleting the phrase ';is guilty of an offence and 

shall be liable on conviction to a fine of not less 
than one ~llion shillings or to imprisonment for 
a tenn of not less than five years or to both such 
fine and imprisonment" appearing in paragraph 
(c) after figure" 13": 

(b) inserting below paragraph (c) the following 
phrase -

"is guilty of an offence and shall be 
liable on conviction to a fine of no.t less 
than five million shillings or to 
imprisonment for a term of not less than 
fi ve years or to both. " 

S. The principal Act is amended in section 18 by -
(a) adding new paragraph (c) in subsection (1) as 

follows: 
"( c) for the purpose of exchange of 

information required under 
section 147A." 

(b) deleting the word "one" and substituting for it the 
word "five" appearing in subsection (2). 

6. 
deleting

(a) 

The principal Act is amended in section 20 by 

in subsection (6)-
(i) the phrase '·of section 18 or 

subsection (1) or (2)" appearing 
immediately after figure "(3)"; 
and 



No.lO 

Amendment of 
section 21 

CapitaL Markets And Securities (Amendments) 2U1U 11 

(ii) the words "one hundred 
thousand" and substituting for 
them the words "ten million 
appearing inunediately after the 
words "five not exceeding"; 

(b) in subsection (7)-
(i) the words "subsection (1), (2) 

or (3) of section 18 or"; and 
(ii) the word "one" and sUbstituting 

for it the word "five" appearing 
after the word "than". 

~ 

7. The principal Act is amended by repeali ng secti on 21 
and replacing it with the foUo\ving: 

"Investiga- 21.-(1) Where the Authority has 
tion of reason to suspect that any person is 
certain involved in any fraudulent or unfair 
matters practice on a securities market it may 

conduct an investigation as it think 
proper. 

(2) For the purposes of 
investigation under this section, the 
Authority may inspe~t the book, accounts, 
document and transactions of any person. 

(3) The powers of investigation 
under subsection (2), may be exercised by 
the Authority itself or by any person 
appointed in writing by the Authority to 
exercise those powers. 

(4) For the purpose of an 
investigation under this section, a person 
shall afford the Authority or any person 
appointed by the AuthoIity under 
subsection (3) access to, and shall 
produce, its or his books, accounts and 
documents and shall give such 
documents, infonnation and facilities as 
may be required to conduct the 
inspection. 



12 No.IU 

Amendment of 
section 22 

CapitaL Markets And Securities (Amendments) 2U1U 

(5) The Authority and any 
person appointed by the Authority shall 
for the purposes of investigations have the 
power to copy or take possession of the 
books, accounts and other documents of 
any person. 

(6) Any person \l/ho. without 
reasonable excuse, fails to produce any 
book, account or document or furnish any 
infonnation or facilities in accordance 

~ with subsection (3), is guilty of an offence 
and shall be liable on conviction to a fine 
of not less than five million shillings or to 
imprisonment for a tenn of not less than 
fi ve years or to both." 

8. The principal Act is amended by repealing section 
22 and replacing it with the following provisions: 

"Measures to 22.-(1) The Authority may, for 
be taken reasons to be recorded in writing, in the 
pending interests of investors or the securities 
investigations market, take any of the following 

measures, either pending investigations or 
on,colnp)etion of investigations-

(a) suspend the .trading of any 
security on a stock 
exchange; 

(b) restrai n any person from 
accessing the secuntlcs 
market and prohibit any 
person associated with a 
securities market to buy, 
sell or deal in securities; 

(c) suspend any office-bearer 
of any stock exchange or 
self-regulatory 
organization, market 
intermediary or any issuer 
of securities from holding 
such position; 



No.lU CapitaL Markets And Securities (Amendments) 2U1U 13 

(d) impound and retain 
proceeds of securities with 
respect to any transaction 
which IS under 
investigation~ 

(e) attach one or more bank 
accounts of any 
intermediary or any person 
associated ",;1-h 

Y'r 1 ~J.l 
tho 
u.J~ 

securities market in any 
manner in vol ved In 
violition of any of the 
provisions of this Act, or 
the rules or the regulations 
made thereunder; and 

(f) direct any intennediary or 
any person associated with 
the securities market in any 
manner not to dispose of or 
alienate an asset forming 
part of any transaction 
which IS under 
investigations. 

(2) Subject to subsection (1), the 
bank account or accounts or any 
transaction entered therein, so far as it 
relates to the proceeds actually involved 
in violation of any of the provisions of 
this Act shall be allowed to be attached. 

(3) The Authority may take any 
of the measures under this secti on against 
any person where the Authority has 
reasonable grounds to believe that such 
person has'· been in vol ved in insider 
trading, market manipulation, fraudulent 
or unfair practices relating to securities 

market. 



14 No.lU 

Amendment of 
section 23 

Amendment of 
section 25 

Amendment of 
section 28 

Amendment of 
section 30 

Amendment of 
section 31 

Capital Markets And Securities (Amendme!lts) 2U1U 

(4) For the purpose of subsection 
(3), the Authority may either before or 
after taking any measures referred to in 
this section afford a person concerned an 
opportunity to be heard." 

9. The principal Act is a..mended in section 23 by 
deleting the word "one" appearing. in subsection (7) and 
substituting for it the word ('fi ve". 

10. The principal Act is amended in section 25 by 
deleting in subsectio~~ (2) -

(i) the phrase "exceeding five hundred thousand 
shillings appearing after the \vords "fine not" and 
substituting for it the phrase "less than fifty million 
and not more than five hundred million shillings;" 

(ii) the word "two" and substituting for it the phrase 
"ten and not more than fifteen years"; 

11. The principal Act is amended in sccti"bn 28 by 
deleting in subsection (5)-

(a) the phrase "or of the Authority" which appears 
after the word ~'exchange"; 

(b) the phrase "Minister whose decision shall be final" 
which appears 'at the end and substituting for it the 
phrase "Authority and where the decision was 
made by the Authority the appeal shall lie to the 
Tribunal" . 

12. The principal Act is amended in section 30 by 
deleting the word "Minister" and substituting for it the word 
"Tribunal". 

13. The principal Act is amended in section 31 by -

(a) deleting the word '"Minister" appearing in 
subsection (4) and (5) and substituting for it the 
word "Tribunal'" and 

(b) deleting the word ~'one" appearing in subsection 
(6) and substituting for it the word "fifty". 



No. 10 L'apitaL Markets And Securities (Amendments) 201U 15 

Amendment of 14. The principal Act is amended by repealing section 
32 and repiacing it with the following provisions: ~cction 3~ 

Repealing of 
sections 33,34 
and 35 

Amendment 
of section 39 

Amendment 
of section 48 

Repealing of 
section 49 

Amendment 
of section 50 

"Requirement 32. A person shall not act in the 
for licences capacity of-

(a) a dealer; 
(b) a dealers' representati yes ~ 
(c) an investment advisor; 
(d) an investment advisor's 

representati ve; or 
(e) any other market 

intermediary , 
unless he i~ the holder of a licence or 
certificate for that purpose granted under 
this Part of the Act." 

15. The principal Act is amended by repealing sections 
33, 34, and 35. 

16. 
deleting -

(a) 

The principal Act is amended in section 39 by 

the phrase "two hundred thousand" and substituting 
for it the words "ten million" ; 

(b) the word "two" and substituting for it the word 
Hfive" which appears after me words Htem1 of not 
less than"; 

17. The principal Act is amended by repealing section 48 
and replacing it with the follo\\fing: 

"Appeal 
against 
the 
decision 
of the 
Authority 

48.-( 1) Any person who is aggrieved 
by the decision of the Authority refusing to 
grant, renew, suspend or revoke a licence 
may appeal to the Tribunal, within thirty days 
from the date of receiving such decision." 

18. The principal Act "is amended by repealing section 
49. 

19. The principal Act is amended in section 50 by adding 
immediately after paragraph (d) the following paragraph: 

"( e) any other market intermediary as the Minister 
may prescribe in the Regulations." 



16 No.lU (;apitaL Markets And Securities (Amendments) 2010 

Amendment 20, The principal Act is amended in section 52(5) by 

(a) the phrase "one hundred thousand" and substituting 
for it the words "one million"; 

(b) the word "fifty" and substituting for it the words 
"one hundred" appears in third line. 

Amendment 21. The principal Act is amended in section 59( 10) by 
of section 59 rif':1f>.t1ncr _ 

Amendment 
of section 60 

Amendment 
of section 61 

Amendment 
of section 63 

Amendment 
of section 64 

Amendment 
of section 65 

Amendment 
of section 67 

Amendment 
of section 69 

-------.0 
(a) the words "one hundred thousand" and 

substituting for it the words "five nnllion", 
(b) the words 'M"ifty thousand" and substituting for it 

the words "one hundred thousand". 

22. The principal Act is amended in section 60(3) by 
deleting the \-yards "five hundred thousand" and substituting for it 
the words "five million". 

23. The principal Act is amended in section 61 (7) by 
deleting the words "one hundred thousand" and substituting for it 
the words "ten million", 

24. The principal Act is amended in section 63(2), by 
deleting the \vords "five hundred thousand" and substituting for it 
the words "ten million", 

25. The principal Act is amended in section 64(2) by 
deleting the words "two million" and substituting for it the words 
"twenty million". 

26. The principal Act is amended in section 65(2) by 
deleting the words "five hundred thousand" and substituting for it 
ti1e words "two million", 

. 27. The principal Act is amended in section 67(2) by 
deleting the words "two hundred thousand" and substituting for it 
the words "five million". 

28. The principal Act is amended in section 69 by -

(a) deleting ihe word '·one" which appears 10 

subsection (6) and substituting for it the word 
"fi ve"; 



No.1U 

Amendment 
of section 70 

Amendment 
of section 72 

Amendment 
of section 95 

Amendment 
of section 97 

Amendment 
of sections 
98, 101 and 
102 

Amendment 
of section 106 

Amendment 
of se{;tion 107 

Capital Markets Aru:1 Securities (Amendments) 2UIO 17 

(b) deleting the \vord "five" which appears in 
subsection (7) and substituting for it the word 
"fifty" . 

29. 
deleting -

(a) 

The principal Act is amended in section 70 by 

the word "two" \vhich appears in the penultimate 
paragraph and substituting for it the word 
"h'llenty" 

(b) the word "five" wbich appears in sUbseption (2) 
and substituting for it the word "fifty"; and 

(c) the word "t\VO" which appears in subsection (8) 
and substituting for it the word "twenty". 

30. The principal Act is amended in section 72(2) by 
deleting the word "Court" and substituting for it the word .. 
"Tribunal" . 

31. The principal Act is amended in section 95, by 
deleting the word "Court" and substituting for it the word 
"Tribunal" . 

32.. The principal Act is amended tn section 97 by 
deleting -
(a) the phrase "to a judge of the high Court who" 

which appears in subsection (3) and substituting 
for it the phrase "to the Authority which"; 

(b) the word "Court" which appears in subsection (7) 
and substituting for it the word "Tribunal. 

33. The principal Act is amended in sections 98, 101 and 
102, by deleting the word "Court" and substituting for it the word 
"Tribunal" . 

34. The principal Act is amended in section 106 by 
inserting after the words "in Tanzania" appearing in subsection (1) 
the words "or outside Tanzania". 

35. The principal Act is amended in section 1 07 by 
inserting after the word "in Tanzania" appearing in subsection (1) 
the words "or outside Tanzania". 



1M NO. 1U L'apital Markets And Securities (Anzendments) 2U1U 

Amendment 
of section 113 

Amendment 
of section 115 

Amendment 
of section 116 

Amendment 
of sections 
122, 125,126 
and 127 

Amendment 
of section l29 

Amendment 
of section 13 1 

36. The principal Act is amended in section 113 by 
deleting the words ~:five': and substituting for it the word "fifti~. 

37. The principal Act is amended in section 115 by 
deleting the word "not exceeding anen and substituting for it the 
\vords "not less than fifty milUon". 

38. The principal Act is amended in section 116, by 
deleting the words "not exceeding one" which appear in paragraph 
(b) and substituting for them the \vords '"not less than t\venty 
million". 

39. The principal Act is amended in sections 122, 125, 
126 and 127, by deleting the words "High Court" or "Court" and 
substituting for them the word "Tribunal". 

40. The principal Act is amended in section 129 by 
deleting the words "not exceeding five hundred thousand" and 
substituting for them the words "qot less than fifty million". 

41. The principal Act is amended by repealing section 
131 and replacing for it the following-

"Approval 131.-( 1) No person shall issue or 
of cause to be issued an advertisement offering 
prospectus securities unless the issuer has-

(a) submitted for approval by the 
Authority and the Authority 
has approved a prospectus 
which complies with the 
requirements of this Part; 

(b) appointed advisors who shall 
include but not limited to the 
Lead Advisor, Sponsoring 
Broker, Independent 
Reporting Accountant and a 
Le gal Ad visor; 

(2) In the case of an application 
for issue of securities in the Enterprise 
Growth Market, the issuer shall, in addition 
to advisors referred to in subsection (1 )(b), 
appoint a Nominated Advisor." 



No.lU 

Amendment 
uf sedion 134 

Amendment 
of section 135 

Amendment 
of section 
136 

Addition of 
new Parts 

Capital Markets And Securities (Amendments) 201U 19 

42. The principal Act is amended in section 134 by 
deleting the words "not exceeding five hundred thousand'~ which 
appear in subsection (5) and substituting for them the words "not 
less than fifty million", 

43. The principal Act is amended in section 135 by 
deleting the words "not exceeding three hundred thousand" which 
appear in subsection (5) and substituting for them the words "five 
million", 

44. The principal Act is amended in section 136 by 
deleting the phrase "not exceeding five hbndred thousand" which 
appear In subsection (6) and substituting for it the words "five 
million", 

45. The principal Act is amended by adding a ne\v Part 
XIllA immediately after Part xm as follows: 

"PART XIIIA 
ESTABLISHMENT, JlJRISDICTION 

AND PROCEDURE FOR APPELLATE TRIBUNAL 

"Establish
meI)t of the 
Tribunal 

136A.-( 1) There shall be 
established an independent Tribunal to 
be known as the Capital Markets 
Tribunal which shall, subject to this 
Act, have jurisdiction in respect of 
matters specified in subsection (2), 

(2) The Tribunal shall, in the 
perfonnance of its functions and the 
exercise of its powers, have all the 
po\\'ers of the High Court including, 
but not limited to-

(a) enforcing the attendance of 
witness and exarrurung 
them on oath, affinnation 
or otherwise; 

(b) compelling the discovery 
and production of 
documents; and 



2U No.1U Capital Markets An.a Securities (Alnendments) 2U1U 

Composition 
of the 
Tribunal 

Eligibility of 
members 

Tenure of 
office of 
members 

(c) issuing of a cOlllmission or 
renuP:sh no , - ---0 for 
examination of witnesses 
abroad. 

136B. The Tribunal shall 
consist of-

(a) a Chainnan who shall be 
::. pprc:on hn1d;nrr 0;-..... ....... ... v 6A AA."-'A. 1.1A6 ... 

qualified to hold the 
office of a Judge of the 

~ High Court, appointed 
by the President after 
consultation with the 
Chief Justice; and 

(b) four melllbefS who have 
knowledge and 
experience on the capital 
markets one of whom 
shall be a lawyer, 
appoi nted by the 
Minister. 

136C. No person shall be 
appointed as a member of the Tribunal 
unless he qualifies for appointment by 
virtue of his· knowledge of, or 
experience in Ia\v, norms, practices at'1.d 
operations of the capital markets. 

136D. A member of the 
Tribunal shall hold office for a period 
not exceeding three years and shall be 
eligible for re- appointment unless, 
prior to the expiration of that period-

(a) resIgns his office by 

(b) 

written notification 
under his hand 
addressed to the 
Minister; 
the Minister, 
satisfied that 
member is unfit by 

being 
the 



No.IU Capitall0.arkets And Securities (Ameruinzenfs) 201U 21 

Quorum of 
meetings 

Remuneration of 
members 

Jurisdiction of 
the Tribunal 

reason of mental or physical . 
infirmity to perform the duties 
of his office, or that the 
member has failed without 
lea ve or good cause to attend at 
least three consecutive 
meetings of the Tribunal, 
revokes his appointment. 

136E.-( 1) The quorum for 
meetings of the Tribunal shall be 
the ChainnAn and two other 
members. 

(2) The Tribunal shall sit at 
the time and place as it may 
appoint. 

136F. The tenns and 
conditions of service of the 
members and their remuneration 
shall be such as may be prescribed 
in their letters of appointment. 

136G .-( 1 ) . The Tri bunal 
shall have powers to adjudicate on 
disputes and controversies arising 
under this Act. 

(2) \Vithout prejudice to t.~e 

generality of subsection (1), the 
Tribunal shall adjudicate on 
matters relating to-

Ca) the interpretation of 
any enactlnent or 
regulations to which 
this Act applies; 

(b) dispute between the 
Authority and the stock 
exchanges; 

(c) dispute between the 
Authority and any 
nlarket intermediaries; 



22 No.lU Capital Markets And Securities (Amendments) 2U1U 

(d) dispute between market 
intermediaries and their 
clients; 

(e) dispute between listed 
companies and the 
regulators or the 
securities exchange; 

(f) refusal by the 
Authority to grant a 
licence; 

(g) imposition by the 
Authority of limitations 
or restrictions on a 
licence; 

(h) suspension or 
revocation of a licence 
by the Authority; .. 

(i) refusal to admit 
securities on a stock 
exchange; 

U) suspension of trading 
of a security on a stock 
exchange; 

(k) removal of a security 
from the official list of 
a stock exchange; and 

(1) any other dispute 
arising in the course of 
discharge of the 
functions of the 
Authority under this 
Act. 

(3) The Tribunal shall have 
no criminal jurisdiction. 

( 4) Where in the course of 
investigation, . the Authority 
discovers that there is evidence of 
possible corn.rnission of a criminal 
offence, it shall infonn an 



No.lU Capital Markets And Securities (Amendments) 201U 23 

Appeals from 
the decisions 
of the 
Authority 

appropriate criminal prosecuting 
authority. 

136H.-( 1) A person 
aggrieved by an action or decision 
of the Authority under this Act may 
lodge an appeal to the Tribunal 
I"lgl"l;n"t C'" 11 Ch doc;s;on ~l'l'th~n thl'T-ty a c.u. ~ "U 1 V 1. 1 1 VY LJ.l1. U 1 l 

days from the date of the action or 
decision o~ the Authority was 
communicated to the aggrieved 
party. 

(2) No appeal shall lie to the 
Tribunal from an order made by the 
Authority with the consent of the 
parties. 

(3) In the determination of 
the appeal, the Tribunal may 
confirm or rescin4 the decision of 
the Authority or give such direction 
as it may deem appropriate for the 
determination of the appeal. 

( 4) Where an appeal has 
been lodged to the Tribunal against 
any decision of the Authority, the 
decision of the Authority shall 
remain in force until a final decision 
of the Tribunal is delivered, 

(5) A decision of the 
Tribunal reversing or rescinding the 
decision of the Authority shall not 
be enforced until the time for 
lodging an appeal has expired or 
where the appeal has been lodged, 
until the appeal has been 
determined. 



24 No.lU Capital Markets And Securities (A,nendnzents) 2UIU 

Amendment 
of section 140 

Amendment 
of section 143 

Amendment 
of section 144 

Addition of 
section 
147A 

A ppeals to the 
court of 
Appeal 

Powers and 
procedures of 
the Tribunal 

(6) Until the establishment 
of the T'ribunal, appeals and powers 
of determination of the appeals shall 
be exercised by the Minister and the 
provisions of this section shall 
apply lnutatis mutandis in respect 
wi th the exerci se of powers of the 
Tribunal by the Minister. 

136 1. Any person 
dissatisfied with a decision of the 
tribunal may appeal against that 
decision on points of law to the 
Court of Appeal of Tanzania upon 
giving notice in writing to the 
Tribunal within thirty days from the 
date on which the decision was 
made. 

136J. The Tribunal may 
make Rules for regulating its 
proceedings. " 

46. The principal Act IS amended in section 140, by 
deleting the word "one" which appears in the penultimate 
paragraph and substituting for it the word ·'five". 

47. The principal Act is amended in section 143 by 
deleting the words "Court" or "I-ligh Court" and "Court" and 
substituting for them the word "Tribunal". 

48. The principal Act is amended in section 144 by 
deleting -

(a) the word "Court" or "High Court" and 
substituting for them the word "Tribunal"; 
and 

(b) subsection (3). 

49. The principal Act is amended by adding 
immediately after section 147 the following new provisions. 



No.1U Capitallvlarkets And Securities (Amendments) 201U 25 

"Assistance to 
foreign 
authorities 

147A-(1) The Authority may, upon 
receiving a \-vritten 

request from a foreign supervIsory 
authority for assistance to 
investigate into an alleged breach of 
a legal or regulatory requirement 
which the foreign supervIsory 
authority enforces or administers, 
and if it considers it necessary in the 
interest of th~ public -

(a) provide assistance by 
carrying au t 
investigations of all 
the aIle ged breach of 
the legal or regulatory 
req uiremen t; or 

(b) provide other 
assistance, 

to the foreign supervisory authority 
as the Authority thinks fit. 

(2) For the purpose of 
subsection (1), the provisions of 
Part IX shall, apply and have effect 
accordingly as if the breach of the 
legal or regulatory requirernent 
were an offence under this Act. 

(3) In determining whether it 
is in the interest of the public to 
render assistance under subsection 
(1), the Authority shall have regard 
to whether the -

(a) foreign supervIsory 
authority shall pay to 
the Authority any costs 
and expenses incurred 
for providing the 
foreign supervisory 



26 No. 1U Capital Markets And Securities (Amendments) 201U 

Addition of 
Section 151 

authority with the 
assistance; 

(b) foreign supervisory 
authority shall be able 
and willing to provide 
reciprocal assistance 
within its jurisdiction 
in response to a request 
for assistance from the 
Authority; and 

(c) requesting foreign 
supervisory authority is 
a signatory to the 
Multilateral 
Memorandum of 
Understanding of the 
International 
Organization of 
Securities 
Commissions. " 

50. 'The principal Act is amended by adding immediately 
after section 150 a new Section 151 which reads: 

"Powers 
over other 
legislation 

151. Vvnere the provisions of this Acts is in 
conflict or is otherwise inconsistent with a 
provision of any other written law relating to 
listing of shares to the stock exchange, the 
provision of this Act shall prevail to the extent of 
such inconsistency." 

Passed in the National Assembly on the 16 th April, 2010. 

Dr, !.h.?.009 .. P'.' . .J<h,~~L'/ v-.-fr. 
Clerk of the National Assembly 


